
 

 

 

 

          10 December 2021 

 

Request 

1. Who owns the St. John Recreational Ground? 

2. What is the St John Centre Ltd? Who are its owners? 

3. Who is on the St John’s Recreational Board? 

4. Who is on the St Johns Skating Association? 

5. In what capacity did Andy Jehan attend the meeting on the 8th June 2021? 

6. Who has made requests, and who has turned down requests from CCTV at St John’s Rec skatepark? 

7. Where can we see a copy of the licence agreement between St John Skating Association and St 
John’s Recreational Board? Who signed this? 

8. What are the St John’s Recreational Board’s specific concerns around additional Insurance and 
Safeguarding, pertaining to the skateboard facility? 

9. VERY IMPORTANT Where can we see the current business plan for SJRB (in the previous FOI 
“SJRG” is referred to – assuming this is a typo and SJRB is meant). 

 

Response 

1. The St John’s Recreation Ground (Centre) is owned by the Billy Butlin Memorial Trust. 

2. This information is exempt. 

Article 23 - Information accessible to applicant by other means  

Information is absolutely exempt information if it is reasonably available to the applicant, 
otherwise than under this Law, whether or not free of charge. A scheduled public authority 
that refuses an application for information on this ground must make reasonable efforts to 
inform the applicant where the applicant may obtain the information. 

Justification for exemption 

St John Centre Limited is another name of St John Centre Trust which is a registered Jersey 
Charity no. 419, registered with the Jersey Charity Commissioner and the information is 
available on Public Register Charities Register (charitycommissioner.je).  

3. This information is not held by the Parish. 

4. This information is not held by the Parish. 

5. This information is exempt. 

Article 23 - Information accessible to applicant by other means  

Information is absolutely exempt information if it is reasonably available to the applicant, 
otherwise than under this Law, whether or not free of charge. A scheduled public authority 
that refuses an application for information on this ground must make reasonable efforts to 
inform the applicant where the applicant may obtain the information. 

  

https://portal.charitycommissioner.je/Public-Register/


 

 

 

Justification for exemption 

The information has been published in response to a FOI request (available here) which 
stated that Andrew Jehan attended as a Director of St John Centre Limited and a Trustee of 
the St John Centre Trust in his own name and not in his capacity as Connétable of St John.  

6. This information is not held by the Parish. 

7. The licence agreement between St John Skating Association and St John’s Recreational Board is not 
held by the Parish.  
The Parish holds a copy of the licence agreement between the St John Centre Limited and the Parish 
of St John relating to the Skateboard Park (the original licence was signed by the then Chairman of 
the Centre and the Connétable of the Parish).  

8. This information is not held by the Parish. 

9. This information is not held by the Parish. 

 

 

 

https://comite.je/wp-content/uploads/sites/13/2021/12/St-John-Recreation-June-2021-meeting.pdf

