
 

 

 

 

         14 November 2022 

 

Request 

A list of all gifts and hospitality received by Parish officials, including the Constable, Procureurs, Roads 
Committee and officers from 1 Jan 2021 until 30 September 2022. A copy of any policies that each Parish 
applies to the above. 
 

 

Response 

St Brelade 

Gifts under the value of £25 are not recorded in the register. 

A Christmas hamper valued about £200.00 was received and shared amongst the staff. The Connétable 
received hospitality from the Parish lawyer (buffet and drinks) at a televised rugby match shown locally. 

 

St Clement 

Gifts under the value of £25 are not recorded in the register. 

Date Given to Item declared Approx value 

4.2.2021 Office staff Case of wine £55 (£8.99 per bottle) 

18.2.2021 Office staff Laurent-Perrier Champagne £30 

24.2.2021 Office staff Pastries £25/£30 

10.3.2021 Office staff Handtied flowers £35/£40 

 

Grouville  

Gifts only accepted after approval by manager. 

Date Given to Item declared Approx value 

31.03.2022 All Staff Jersey Potatoes  £20.00 

14.06.2022 All Staff Cakes £20.00 

10.06.2022 Staff Member Box of chocolates £5.00 

10.06.2022 All staff Box of chocolates £5.00 

27.06.2022 All staff Box of Chocolates £5.00 

28.06.2022 All staff Cakes £10.00 

11.07.2022 All staff and caretaker 5 punnets of home grown tomatoes £10.00 

22.08.2022 All staff and caretaker 5 punnets of home grown tomatoes £10.00 

 

  



 

 

St Helier 

Date gift / 
hospitality 
offered 

Accepted 
/ declined 

Dept Role Received 
from 
(Name, 
position & 
organis-
ation)  

Descripti
on of 
Gift/Hos
pitality 
received  

Value £ 
(Estimate 
if 
unknown)  

Reason 
given for 
providing 
gift/ 
hospitality  

05.02.21 Accepted Community 
Services 

Employee Parishioner Chocolat
es 

£13.00 Thank you 
gift 

12.02.21 Accepted Constable Constable Commercia
l ratepayer 

Champag
ne 

£20.00 Client 
relationship 

23.02.21 Accepted Community 
Services 

Employee Parishioner 4 Bottles 
of Wine 

£35.00 Thank you 
gift 

02.12.21 Accepted CEO Office Director / 
Head of 
Dept 

Commercia
l ratepayer 

Drinks 
and meal 
on 
08.12.21 

£50.00 Client 
relationship 

09.12.21 Accepted Community 
Services 

Manager 
& 
employee 

Commercia
l ratepayer 

Small 
Hamper 

£25.00 Thank you 
gift 

14.12.21 Accepted Finance  Director / 
Head of 
Dept 

Commercia
l ratepayer 

Bottle of 
wine 

£40.00 Client 
relationship 

21.12.21 Accepted Infrastructu
re 

Director / 
Head of 
Dept 

Commercia
l ratepayer 

Scented 
candles 

£30.00 Client 
relationship 

21.12.21 Accepted CEO Office 
/ Finance / 
Infrastructu
re 

Director / 
Head of 
Dept 

Commercia
l ratepayer 

Hamper £40.00 
each 
hamper 

Client 
relationship 

04.03.22 Accepted Community 
Services 

Manager Parishioner'
s daughter 

Box of 
chocolate
s 

£10.00 Thank you 
gift 

28/04/2021 Accepted Constable Constable Jersey 
Bulls 

Lunch & 
match 

£50.00 Client 
relationship 

16/05/2021 Accepted Constable Constable Jersey Old 
Motor Club 

Lunch  £50.00 Client 
relationship 

20/06/2021 Accepted Constable Constable Normandy 
Veterans 
Association 

Lunch £50.00 Client 
relationship 

26/06/2021 Accepted Constable Constable Jaguar 
Owners 
Club 

Dinner £50.00 Client 
relationship 

29/06/2021 Accepted Constable Constable UK MP Dinner £50.00 Client 
relationship 

15/08/2021 Accepted Constable Constable Ladbrokes Day at 
the races 

£50.00 Client 
relationship 

30/10/2021 Accepted Constable Constable Indian 
Community 

Diwali 
event 

£50.00 Client 
relationship 

01/12/2021 Accepted Constable Constable Modern 
Hotels 
Group 

Lunch    £50.00 Client 
relationship 

12/02/2022 Accepted Constable Constable Portuguese 
Community 

Dinner £50.00 Client 
relationship 

18/02/2022 Accepted Constable Constable Jersey 
Hospitality 
Association 

Lunch  £50.00 Client 
relationship 

24/04/2022 Accepted Constable Constable Jersey 
Bowling 

Lunch £50.00 Client 
relationship 



 

 

Club 

02/07/2022 Accepted Constable Constable Jersey 
Bulls 

Lunch & 
match 

£50.00 Client 
relationship 

11/08/2022 Accepted Constable Constable Jersey 
Battle of 
Flowers 
Association 

Lunch & 
Parade 

£50.00 Client 
relationship 

14/08/2022 Accepted Constable Constable Ladbrokes Day at 
the races 

£50.00 Client 
relationship 

2022 Accepted Constable Constable Mayor of 
Trenton 

Clothing £40.00 Client 
relationship 

 

St John  

Gifts under the value of £40 are not recorded. No gifts or hospitality received during the period 1 January 
2021 to 30 September 2022. 

 

St Lawrence  

Gifts under the value of £40 are not recorded. No gifts or hospitality received during the period 1 January 
2021 to 30 September 2022. 

The Parish was gifted a Defibrillator which was installed at St Matthew’s Church – 16/02/2021 

 

St Martin 

Gifts of a token value are not recorded. There is no register for the period as only gifts of token value have 

been received (biscuits, chocolates, around the festive season etc.); these are shared amongst all staff. No 

gifts of hospitality have been received.  

Gifts of benches and trees have been made to the Parish and these have been located within the Parish e.g. 

Village Green, for the use of all Parishioners. 

 

St Mary  

Gifts and hospitality received prior to January 2022 were not recorded in a register (see FOI response in 

2021). The register of gifts and hospitality from 1 January to 30 September 2022 is as follows –  

Date Gift/Hospitality Approx. value To  

Jan-22 1 Small Box of Roses £5.00 Hon Police 

Jan-22 £10.00 Cash £10.00 Hon Police 

Mar-22 Chocolates £5.00 Office Staff  

Mar-22 Chocolates  £5.00 Office Staff  

Apr-22 Biscuits  £5.00 Office Staff  

May-22 Chocolates  £5.00 Office Staff  

Aug-22 1 Box of Eggs £3.00 Hon Police 

 

St Ouen  

Gifts under the value of £10 are not recorded. 

Date Item declared Approx value To  

01.04.2021 1 bottle Rose wine each £13 per bottle Office staff 



 

 

07.04.2021 £10 cash each £40 Office staff 

15.04.2021 1 bag of Jersey Royals each £10 in total Office staff 

11.06.2021 28 scallops £28 Office staff 

25.06.2021 Cream cakes £15 Office staff 

09.07.2021 1 bottle Rose wine each £13 per bottle Office staff 

22.07.2021 1 bottle white wine, 2 pkts biscuits, 2 pots pate £10.00 Office staff 

26.07.2021 I bottle champagne  £40 Office staff 

17.09.2021 2 bunches of Roses and packet of chocolates £12 Office staff 

12.11.2021 Chocolates and flowers £20 Office staff 

30.12.2021 Stollen cake, Panettone, Champagne £48 Office staff 

16.12.2021 1 Port, 4 wine, Large biscuits £50 Office staff 

16.12.2021 3 wine, 3 La Mare biscuits, 3 choc £30 Office staff 

24.12.2021 Scarf £20 Office staff 

24.12.2021 Raspberry Gin  £26 Office staff 

24.12.2021 L & P Rose £50 Office staff 

24.12.2021 Red & white wine £20 Office staff 

24.12.2021 Red Wine  £20 Office staff 

24.12.2021 Red & White wine £20 Office staff 

24.12.2021 Bottle Rose £10 Office staff 

13.04.2022 New Potatoes £20 Office staff 

13.04.2022 Flowers and chocolates £20 Office staff 

27.06.2022 Champagne and Gift voucher £55 Office staff 

27.06.2022 Champagne £15 Office staff 

28.06.2022 Flowers and chocolates  £25 Office staff 

28.06.2022 Box chocolates £5.00 Office staff 

 

St Peter  

Given to Date Item declared Approx value 

Parish 01/12/2020 Bottle of Red Wine £20  

Parish 07/06/2021 Bottle of Rose wine, 2 pks biscuits £10  

Parish 16/07/2021 2 boxes Thornton chocolates £10 for both 

Parish 13/08/2021 4 x Cupcakes £10 

Constable 08/09/2021 1 Bottle Red Wine £10 

Parish 26/11/2021 2 Tubs of sweets £10 

Constable 29/11/2021 2 Bottles Wine £10 each 

Parish 09/12/2021 12 Cupcakes £30  

Parish 13/12/2021 2 Tubs of sweets £10 

Parish 20/12/2021 Tub of sweets, 2 diaries £10 

Roads Committee member 17/12/2021 Bottle of wine £10 

Parish 07/04/2022 Bottle of Wine £10 

Chef de Police 27/05/2022 Bottle of Wine £10 

Parish 01/09/2022 Box of Chocolates £9 

  



 

 

 

St Saviour  

Gifts under the value of £25 are not recorded. No gifts or hospitality received during the period 1 January 
2021 to 30 September 2022. 

 

Trinity  

Gifts under the value of £50 are not recorded. Other than hospitality received by the Connétable (see below) 
no gifts or hospitality were received by any parish officials during the period 1 January 2021 to 30 September 
2022. 

The policy is available on the Parish website at Policies | Parish of Trinity  

“Gifts, hospitality, travel or any other perceived benefits should generally not be accepted, other than 
in so far as offence may be caused if refused, or where the gift may be appropriately displayed or 
utilised by the Parish. Where accepted, items of a value of over £50 should be recorded in the Parish 
gift register.” 

During the relevant period, the Connétable received two tickets to the Durrell Jewels of Aslam Ball. 

 

 

https://parishoftrinity.je/policies/

