
 

 

 

          24 June 2024 

Request 

Grouville Parish Hall is due to have its grand opening on Sunday, June 2nd. Once this event has occurred, 
please could you provide the guest-list and the total cost of the event including donations or benefits in kind. 
In addition, please provide any email correspondence pertaining to the Opening and any public 
advertisement. 

Response 

Guest list – this information is not held; an open invitation was extended to all Grouville Parishioners to view 
the newly refurbished Parish Hall.  

FOI exemption applied: 

Article 10 - Obligation of scheduled public authority to confirm or deny holding information 

(1) Subject to paragraph (2), if – 

(a) a person makes a request for information to a scheduled public authority; and 

(b) the authority does not hold the information, it must inform the applicant accordingly 

Total cost – £590.62 for refreshments (no donations/benefits in kind). 

Email correspondence pertaining to arrangements for the event and notification to members of the 
municipality is below. 

FOI exemption applied: 

Article 25(2) - Personal Information - Personal data, applicant not subject but supply 
contravenes data protection principles  

Information is absolutely exempt information if – (a) it constitutes personal data of which the applicant 
is not the data subject as defined in the Data Protection (Jersey) Law 2018; and (b) its supply to a 
member of the public would contravene any of the data protection principles, as defined in that Law. 

Public advertisements – invitations were extended through the Parish website news page and Facebook (see 
below). The Parish website News and Events page includes a sign-up option whereby the Parish sends news 
and event information by email the evening it is posted on the website (currently over 200 subscribers to this 
service). 
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