
 

           2 March 2026 

 

Request 

Under the Freedom of Information (Jersey) Law 2011, I am writing to request information relating to the 
unannounced closure of several parking spaces along Grands Vaux reservoir in or around September 2024, 
including the subsequent installation of prohibition (yellow) lines. 

I understand from correspondence that this decision followed a review of the area and a "significant volume of 
safety concerns and complaints". In this context, I respectfully request the following information: 

Complaints Data -  

For the calendar years 2022, 2023, and 2024, please provide: 

1. The number of complaints received relating specifically to vehicles parked at the Grands Vaux reservoir 
parking area, broken down by year (monthly breakdown if readily available). 

2. Where held, a high-level breakdown of complaints by source, such as: 

o Members of the public 

o Parish or States employees 

o Roads Committee members 

3. A summary or categorisation of complaint types (for example: safety concerns, obstruction, access 
issues). 

Decision-Making and Governance 

4. Copies of, or extracts from, the minutes of any Roads Committee meetings at which the removal or 
restriction of parking at the Grands Vaux reservoir was discussed or agreed. 

5. Any formal reports, briefing notes, or recommendations provided to the Roads Committee that 
informed the decision to introduce the prohibition lines. 

Complaints Procedures 

6. The procedure a member of the public should follow to raise: 

a. A formal complaint about parking in an area without yellow line restrictions; and 

b. A formal complaint relating to the introduction of new parking restrictions or yellow lines, including 
where these are introduced without prior notice. 

 

Response 

The area referred to along the Grands Vaux Reservoir has never contained formally designated parking 
spaces. Vehicles were parked along this stretch of road prior to the introduction of prohibition lines.  

In recent years, following changes to the parking arrangements at Grands Vaux School, displacement parking 
increased along the roadside leading to concerns for road safety due to obstruction and congestion. On-street 
parking in this location reduces visibility and narrows the carriageway thus impacting motorists, cyclists and 
pedestrians. 

The matter was first reviewed during 2020-2021 at which time a limited number of prohibition lines were 
introduced. However, this did not sufficiently resolve the ongoing access and safety concerns. A more 
comprehensive introduction of prohibition lines was approved for an initial 12-month trial period. Following 
review and continued monitoring of traffic conditions during that period, the measures were permanently 
adopted. The is the second tranche of prohibition lines introduced in the Grands Vaux Reservoir area.    

Article 5 of the Road Traffic (St. Saviour) (Jersey) Order 2000 specifies roads where waiting and stopping is 
prohibited (see Schedule 3 of that Order). The restrictions for Grands Vaux are currently – 

https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/ro_97_2000


 

The restrictions at previous points in time can be seen using the setting below on jerseylaw.je - 

 

 

Responses to requests 1, 2 and 3: 

Number of recorded 
Complaints 

Year Complainant Categorisation of complaint 

1* 2022 Member of public All complaints have been categorised under either 
“parking” or “Highways, Gardens & Maintenance”, 
with a sub-category of “Roads Committee”. 
Information is not held in the format outlined. 

6 2023 Members of public 

4 2024 Members of public 

 
* Written complaint only. Any complaints received verbally (by telephone and in person) at the St Saviour Parish 
Hall and by the Parking Control Officers prior to the commencement of the Parish Services Register in 2023 
were not recorded and therefore not held. Since March 2023, the Parish of St Saviour has used the Services 
Register to formally log complaints.  

 

Response to request 4: The extract from the Road Committee minutes 11 October 2023 regarding Grands 
Vaux parking issues is provided below: 

 

The decision to impose restrictions are in the minutes of Road Committee meeting held on 24 January 2024 
which are published on the St Saviour Parish website: Official | MINUTES of the Roads Committee (FOI 
exemption Article 23 applies).  

 

 

https://stsaviour.je/wp-content/uploads/sites/2/2024/11/24-January-2024.pdf


Response to request 5: correspondence from the Connétable of St Saviour to the Minister for Infrastructure in 
2021 and 2024 is attached.  

The Ministerial decision MD-INF-2024-634 is available here Road Traffic (St. Saviour) (Jersey) Order 2000: 
Amendment: Les Grands Vaux and La Rue a la Dame (FOI exemption Article 23 applies). The report of 
Growth, Housing and Environment is attached. 

 

Response to request 6: The procedures that a member of the public should follow when submitting a formal 
complaint can be found on the Parish of St Saviour website: Comments, Compliments and Complaints Policy | 
Parish of St Saviour. (FOI exemption Article 23 applies) 

 

FOI exemption applied: 

Article 23 - Information accessible to applicant by other means  

Information is absolutely exempt information if it is reasonably available to the applicant, otherwise than under 
this Law, whether or not free of charge. A scheduled public authority that refuses an application for information 
on this ground must make reasonable efforts to inform the applicant where the applicant may obtain the 
information. 

 

  

https://www.gov.je/government/planningperformance/pages/ministerialdecisions.aspx?docid=8E1D426F-7D02-4063-B336-3367A0081E66
https://www.gov.je/government/planningperformance/pages/ministerialdecisions.aspx?docid=8E1D426F-7D02-4063-B336-3367A0081E66
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fstsaviour.je%2Fcomments-compliments-and-complaints-policy%2F&data=05%7C02%7Cfoi%40comite.je%7C01d232ee970c4e194d8208de6ee24927%7Ceadceb144f884d729e166fd28a6cfd1c%7C1%7C0%7C639070115344286361%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=6pC5BF22q5kjZIE1ThsvxKil64euNL9ltNvLSToA5jo%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fstsaviour.je%2Fcomments-compliments-and-complaints-policy%2F&data=05%7C02%7Cfoi%40comite.je%7C01d232ee970c4e194d8208de6ee24927%7Ceadceb144f884d729e166fd28a6cfd1c%7C1%7C0%7C639070115344286361%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=6pC5BF22q5kjZIE1ThsvxKil64euNL9ltNvLSToA5jo%3D&reserved=0






















 


