20 April 2026

Request

Could | request and FOI to capture the number of times a speed check has occurred (by both the Police and
Honorary Police on 1) Peirson Road in St Helier, and 2) Lewis St in St Helier, since 2021.

Response

1. Pierson Road — 22 speed checks by the Honorary Police since 2021.

2. Lewis Street — no speed checks by the Honorary Police but a speed identification device (SID) was
installed in Lewis Street in March 2021.

The Parish does not hold details of speed checks by the States of Jersey Police, therefore, Article 10 of the
Freedom of Information (Jersey) Law 2011 applies, however, it may be held by the Government of Jersey so
you might wish to send your information request in writing to:

Central Freedom of Information (FOI) Unit

PO Box 140

19-21 Broad Street
St Helier

Jersey

JE4 8QT

You can also find out more about making an FOI request to the Government of Jersey at: How to make an
FOl request (gov.je)

Article applied

Article 10 - Obligation of scheduled public authority to confirm or deny holding information
(1) Subject to paragraph (2), if —

(a) a person makes a request for information to a scheduled public authority; and

(b) the authority does not hold the information, it must inform the applicant accordingly

Freedom of
Information

Your right to know



https://www.gov.je/Government/FreedomOfInformation/Pages/MakeFOIRequest.aspx
https://www.gov.je/Government/FreedomOfInformation/Pages/MakeFOIRequest.aspx

