



16 June 2026

Request

Please can I have a copy of the following documentation and a response to the following questions from the parish of Grouville and from the Constable of Grouville in respect of the approval for the Jersey Rally to proceed in Grouville in October 2026:

1. Please can I have a copy of the required permission for the rally to proceed in Grouville in 2026 and for the closure of the road (La Rue Des Teurs Champs) from the Constable/Parish under the Parish Road Traffic Jersey Law 1956 and is as stated required on the parish website?
2. Please can I have a copy of the formal application from the JMCLL (Jersey Rally Club) for the road closure and copies of any written dealing with them (to include any emails/text messages/ whatsapp messages)? If the constable has been liaising with the Jersey Rally Club via his personal devices, please can I have copies of these dealings as, I submit that this is official Parish business and as such falls under the FOI Law?
3. Please can I have a copy of the documents filed by the Jersey Rally Club setting out the route of the rally, which should have been provided to the parish prior to approval?
4. Please can you confirm with whom and when informal discussions took place with the Jersey rally club at which the Constable granted permission? please can you provide a statement setting out the details of this discussion and what information the Constable was given on the route and road closures?
5. Please can you confirm what information the Constable requested from the Jersey Rally Club and what factors the Constable considered when agreeing to provide permission for the Rally to proceed and for the relevant road closures?
6. Please can you confirm if my legitimate concerns raised in my emails below were considered by the Constable when he granted permission?
7. Please can you confirm if the Jersey Rally club, who are are aware of my objections, were asked if there were any objections, and what requirements have been put on them to liaise with people directly effected by the event?
8. Please can you confirm if the Constable has managed to amend the route for the Rally in 2026, where this was done, what the concerns were for that route, why the Constable did not consider my concerns when giving his informal approval?
9. if the constable has not issued the road closures, please can you confirm why the constable is not taking account of my legitimate concerns raised below and re-iterated?

10. Please can you confirm if the Constable can amend the conditions of the approval? If so please confirm why the constable has not proposed any changes to the route and is not taking account of my concerns?

11. please can I be provided with copies of all dealings/ correspondence with the Jersey Rally club/ or a representative on this issue since I have raised concerns with the Constable/Parish 10 May 2026 to date? If not in writing please provide dates of calls and accounts of discussions.

Response

1. The information held is attached to this response.

2. The information is not held.

3. The information held is attached to this response.

4. The information is not recorded as the meeting was held via phone with the Jersey Rally organiser.

5. The Jersey Rally 2026 route was the same as prior years and all households on the route were contacted. All signage and barriers were arranged by Jersey Rally to minimise Parish involvement.

6. The information requested is not recorded. All households on the Jersey Rally route were contacted by the Jersey Rally 2026 organisers to discuss their concerns.

7. The information requested is not recorded. All households on the Jersey Rally route were contacted by the Jersey Rally 2026 organisers to discuss their concerns.

8. The information is not held.

9. Jersey Rally is committed to repair any damage caused as soon as possible and this approach has proven effective in previous years.

10. Jersey Rally visited all households on the Jersey Rally 2026 route to discuss their concerns.

11. The documentation held from the meeting held on 10 February 2026 is attached to this response.

